
Huntley Park District - Pavement and Site Improvements Project
Base Bid & Alt.
7/23/2025

Company Name Base Bid Bid Security Alt # 1 Stingray Bay 
ADA Route

Alt# 2 - Include All 
Contracts

Alt. #3 Include Contract 
#01 - Asphalt Paving 

Alt #4 - Include 
Contract #02 - Concrete

Alt #5 - Include 
Contract #03 - Site 

Utilities

Alt #6 Eliminate 
Landscape Scope

Alt. Subtotal: Total Adjusted Bid

01 Asphalt Paving

Schroeder Asphalt Service, Inc. 675,000.00 x 3,000.00 NA N/A 300,000.00 NA (25,000.00) 3,000.00 678,000.00

Champion Paving 683,000.00 x 6,500.00 no bid N/A no bid no bid (30,000.00) 6,500.00 689,500.00

Chicagoland Paving, Inc. 759,000.00 x 10,000.00 NA N/A NA NA NA 10,000.00 769,000.00

Obsidian Asphalt Paving, Inc, 761,847.00 x 12,176.00 no bid N/A no bid no bid (13,400.00) 12,176.00 774,023.00

Maneval Construction Co 775,050.00 x no bid 445,285.00 N/A 238,988.00 206,297.00 (7,000.00) no bid 775,050.00

Abbey Paving 813,187.00 x 1,200.00 478,700.00 N/A 214,825.00 263,375.00 (21,000.00) 1,200.00 814,387.00

02 Concrete Curbs & Concrete Paving

Abbey Construction Company Inc. 232,325.00 x 2,270.00 1,051,565.00 798,187.00 N/A 263,375.00 N/A 2,270.00 234,595.00

Maneval Construction 238,988.00 x included in base bid 981,347.00 775,250.00 N/A 206,297.00 N/A 0.00 238,988.00

Eagle Concrete, Inc. 284,700.00 x no bid no bid no bid N/A no bid N/A 284,700.00

Alliance Construction Corp 285,013.65 x 5,800.00 no bid no bid N/A no bid N/A 285,013.65

Premium Concrete, Inc. 317,000.00 x no bid no bid no bid N/A no bid N/A 317,000.00

03 Site Utilities

Maneval Construction 206,297.00 x NA 1,014,038.00 775,050.00 238,988.00 N/A (3,500.00) 206,297.00

Berger Construction 253,200.00 x NA no bid no bid no bid N/A no bid 253,200.00

Abbey Construction Company Inc. 293,375.00 x NA 1,008,515.00 803,187.00 224,825.00 N/A (21,100.00) 293,375.00

Subtotal Recommended Contractor
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